
It is expected that a Quorum of the Personnel Committee, Board of Public Works, and Administration Committee 
will be attending this meeting: (although it is not expected that any official action of any of those bodies will be 
taken) 
 

 
CITY OF MENASHA 

 Special Joint Common Council and  
Town of Menasha Stormwater Utility Commission 

Town of Menasha Municipal Complex Assembly Room 
2000 Municipal Drive, Neenah, WI 

August 26, 2009 
5:30 PM 

 
AGENDA 

AMENDED 
 

A. CALL TO ORDER 
 

B. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
 

C. ROLL CALL/EXCUSED ABSENCES 
 

D. DISCUSSION ITEMS:  
1. Discussion regarding the Tayco Pond Joint Project 
 

E. PUBLIC COMMENTS ON ANY MATTER LISTED ON THE AGENDA 
(five (5) minutes time limit for each person) 
 

F. ACTION ITEMS 
1.   Approve the Land Purchase for Tayco Pond 
2. Award Bid for Tayco Pond Project 
3. Amend Joint Stormwater Feasibility Intermunicipal Agreement 

    
G. ADJOURNMENT 

 
 
 

"Menasha is committed to its diverse population. Our Non-English speaking population and those with disabilities 
are invited to contact the Menasha City Clerk at 967-3603 24-hours in advance of the meeting for the City to 
arrange special accommodations." 
 

http://www.cityofmenasha-wi.gov/COM/Clerk/Special_Session_Common_Council/2009/CWF-allocation-mntc.%20agrmt.pdf
http://www.cityofmenasha-wi.gov/COM/Clerk/Special_Session_Common_Council/2009/Offer%20to%20Purchase%20and%20appraisal.pdf
http://www.cityofmenasha-wi.gov/COM/Clerk/Special_Session_Common_Council/2009/Letter%20of%20rec.%20and%20bid%20tab.pdf
http://www.cityofmenasha-wi.gov/COM/Clerk/Special_Session_Common_Council/2009/Amend%20Stmwtr%20Feasibility%20Interm.%20Agree.pdf


-----Original Message----- 
From: Sturgell, Jeffrey S. [mailto:jsturgell@town-menasha.com]  
Sent: Thursday, August 20, 2009 5:31 PM 
To: Mark Radtke 
Cc: Dearborn, George; Hull, Ria; Don Merkes 
Subject: FW: RE: CWF Land Purchases 

 Mark, 

Below is the clarification e‐mail I mentioned in the meeting this morning—the state will allow land acquisition to be 
taken from the loan portion of the program but not the grant portion of the program.  However, the grant amount is 
based on 50% of the total project (including the land acquisition) so in a sense the grant covers the land acquisition. 

Jeff 

From: Nick Vande Hey [mailto:NVandehey@mcmgrp.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, August 18, 2009 8:48 AM 
To: Sturgell, Jeffrey S.; Piergrossi, Myra R. 
Cc: Amy VACLAVIK; Andy Schmidt; Lee Reibold 
Subject: Fwd: RE: CWF Land Purchases 

 Jeff & Myra, 

See DNR's response to the land acquisition question posed for Tayco the Pond project.  Thanks.  Nick 
  
Nick Vande Hey, PE 
Associate / Senior Project Engineer  
   
 
1445 McMahon Drive 
Neenah, WI  54957-1025 
    
(920) 751-4200 Office      
(920) 850-1871 Cell 
www.mcmgrp.com 
  
   
>>> "Cargill, Jeanne H - DNR" <Jeanne.Cargill@Wisconsin.gov> 8/18/2009 8:44 AM >>> 

Hi Amy, 

That is correct.  We cannot fund land with ARRA funds; however, because we are funding approximately half of 
each project with CWFP loan dollars, we intend to fund land costs through that portion of the funding.  In the 
majority of cases where we are financing the entire project, 50% of the project costs will be a loan and 50% will 
be grant. 

If a municipality received a CDBG or a grant through Rural Development or some other funding source, and that 
other source indicated that it is not paying for the land through their grant, we could potentially end up giving a 
municipality less than 50% principal forgiveness, depending on the cost of the land, the size of the grant and the 
amount being funded by the CWFP. 

Please let us know if you need further information.  Jeanne 

Jeanne H Cargill  
Financial Assistance Specialist  
Environmental Loans Section  
Bureau of Community Financial Assistance  

http://www.mcmgrp.com/


Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources  
() phone:      (608) 267-7587  
() fax:        (608) 267-0496  
() e-mail:     jeanne.cargill@wisconsin.gov  

 
From: Amy VACLAVIK [mailto:AVACLAVIK@mcmgrp.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, August 18, 2009 8:10 AM 
To: Olson, Daniel J - DNR; Cargill, Jeanne H - DNR 
Cc: Nick Vande Hey 
Subject: CWF Land Purchases 
 
Hi -  Please provide a written (email )response to this question. 
  
It is our understanding that land purchases will be covered by the ARRA/CWF financing.  The ARRA won't cover the land 
cost, but the CWF portion does.  The effect will be that essentially the grant amount is based on the total project cost, 
therefore in a sense 50% of the land cost would be a grant. 
  
Please confirm this, several clients have requested confirmation of this as they move forward with the land purchase.  
Thanks, Amy 
  
  
Amy Vaclavik 
Associate/Senior Project Engineer 
McMAHON 
P.O. Box 1025, Neenah WI  54957 
920-751-4200 ext. 256 
920-751-4284 (fax) 
www.mcmgrp.com 
email - Avaclavik@mcmgrp.com 
  
Confidentiality Statement:  This email and any documents accompanying this transmission may contain confidential information that is legally privileged.  This 
information is intended only for the use of the individuals or entities listed above.  If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any 
disclosure, copying, distribution, or action taken in reliance on the contents of these documents is strictly prohibited.  If you have received this information in 
error, please notify the sender immediately and arrangements will be made for the return or destruction of these documents. 
 

mailto:Avaclavik@mcmgrp.com



























































































































































































